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Introductions :- 
                           The Purna basin is a peculiar region with 
distinct physical setting and socio-economic conditions. 
Purna basin experience slightly different climate than that by 
the rest of two state of Maharashtra, since it is located away 
from the coast it has resulted in high range of mean daily 
temperature which is generally more than 130 C. low altitude 
has resulted in abnormally high maximum summer 
temperature which are normally above 400 C.
             Purna basin in predominantly inhabited by rural 
population. Out of the total population 87.02% population is 
residing in 3053 villages so out of 2677 villages of Purna 
basin; 2429 villages have primary school percentage of the 
primary school were 90.73% middle school were 952 
(35.26%) and high school were 378 (14 %).
Objectives :-
 1. The study of the impact of natural environment on rural 
settlement and its facilities.
2. To study the spatial pattern educational facilities available 
in the rural area of study
     region.
Hypothesis :-
                  The amenities available in the rural settlements 
are inadequate and poor in quality. 
Methodology :- 

              In present research paper utilized secondary data. 
The  data source like district census handbooks, socio-
economics review and statistical abstracts and Gazetteers. 
An attempt  has been made to analysis and interpret the data 
thus collected scientifically  and objectively by applying 
suitable statistical , Cartographic techniques and percentage 
method.
Discussion :- 
                     Purna basin region is backward region in the 
Maharashtra. So the average population per primary school 
is low comparatively to Maharashtra. In Chikhaldara, 
Anjangaon, Murtizapur, Karanja, Barshi-Takli, Shegaon 
tehsils average population per primary school is also low 
because the density is also low and size of settlement are 
generally small. The population per primary school on the 
other hand is high in the tehsils located in the reaming  part of 
the region, where density of population is relatively high and 
there is predominance of large size villages. (fig No. 1.2 )  
Average population per middle schools was considerably 
high in the eastern part of the Purna basin in 1991. In this 
region every tehsils has more than 40 middle schools. In the 
central and western parts tehsils like Motala, Nandura, 
Jalgaon, Balapur, Patur, Akot, Telhara, Anjangaon, Amravati 
have 30 to 40 middle schools in each tehsils, Northern and 
southern hilly region number of middle schools found low 
due to hilly terrain. Generally population per middle schools 
is ranging between 2000 to 4000 in the study region ( fig. 1.2 
).
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The distributional pattern of secondary schools 
shows that the eastern part has  more than 15 secondary 
schools in every tehsils. Generally this part is economically 
prosperous and having urban centers like  Amravati, Akola, 
Daryapur , Anjangaon, Akot. In the south central part of the 
region 10 to 15 villages per tehasls has the facilities of the 
secondary school. Tehsils located on the border areas are 
having less than secondary school the population is low in 
the north-eastern and south central tehsils. As they have 
lower number of secondary schools, population per 
secondary school in 1991 was high in Murtizapur, Edalabad ( 
Mukatainagar ) tehsil with (more than 20000 ). This shows 
that the number of primary schools in relation to population 
is low ( fig. 1.4). Taking into consideration the number of 
middle and secondary schools is clear that the students in the 
rural areas have to go to the near by larger settlement for 
getting education. Another common problem found in the 
rural area of Purna basin in that children spatially girls after 
their primary schools are not continue their educations due to 
poverty.

To fulfill demand of the higher education more 
recently new Arts Science and Commerce Colleges have 
come up in a larger sized villages like Edalabad, Motala, 
Telhara, Bhatkuli, Barshi-Takli, Malegaon, Patur, Bodwad 
etc.
              Recently  at few villages even polytechnics and 
engineering colleges have also been started in the Purna 
basin . In the areas inhabited by tribal's new Ashram school 
have come up where free lodging  and boarding are given to 
the tribal pupils. Besides this the wards of parents where 
annual income is less than Rs.12000/- get free education. The 
students from the SC and ST categories get free education 
and scholarships.

 Majority of the primary schools and secondary 
school are run by the Zilla Parishad some private institutions 
also manage various education institutions. The threshold 
population for every primary school come to 820. In 1991 the 
actual number of primary schools was less than primary 
schools needed as per this threshold value.

 Conclusion :-  
                        Inadequacy of amenities is a major problem 
faced by villagers in rural area of  Purna basin. To overcome 
this problem it is essential to study. Spatial distribution of 
amenities in rural area of the region under study. This showed 
that the distribution of amenities is influenced by variation in 
physical aspects as also in levels of economics and social 
development of the region.
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